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MITCHELSTOWN 
GOLF 

CLUB 
MEN'S CLUB REPORT 

Last weekend saw a 
huge turnout for the 18 
hole open singles competition, 

kindly sponsored 
by McCarthy Insurances, 
Mitchelstown. Conditions 

were mixed over 
the weekend but this did 
not stop some super golf 
being played. 1st place 
went to vice president, 
Michael Nevin playing 

off 12 with 41 points. 
2nd was Michael Hanley 
playing off a handicap 
of 12, and also with 41 
points, he was beaten on 
the count back. Gross 
went to Michael Barrett 
off a handicap of 3 with 
33 gross points. 3rd place 
went to an up and coming 

junior, Adam Carey, 
playing off a handicap of 
21 with 40 points. 

Next weekend, 
August 9th/ioth and 
nth will be an 18 hole 
open singles sponsored 
by Quintas. A new and 
very welcome sponsor to 
Mitchelstown Golf Club 
- Quintas Wealth Management 

is one of Ireland's 
premier wealth 

management firms who 
specialise in the provision 

of unbiased expert 
financial advice. They 
are delighted to sponsor 

this competition at 
Mitchelstown Golf Club 
and hope the club gets 
a great turnout for the 
event. If you would like 
to find out more about 
Quintas, please feel free 
to contact Ian Walsh on 
086 7908872 or email 
iwalsh@qwm.ie. Ian is 
one of Quintas' experienced 

financial advisors 
and is also a member of 
Mitchelstown Golf Club. 


